






A Record of the South Stand, City Stadium, Filbert Street, Leicester 

Summary 

In May 2003 Birmingham University Field Archaeology Unit was commissioned by 
DearsBrack to prepare an archive report on the south stand of the City Stadium, the 
former ground of Leicester City Football Club, situated on Filbert Street just to the 
south of the city centre (NGR SK 58130278). The work was based on a series of 
digital images of the City Stadium taken by the developers prior to the demolition of 
the stadium buildings. The south stand was built in 1927 to the design of Sir E. 0. 

Williams and D.J. Moss, and was a substantial double decker grandstand of brick, 
concrete and steel construction, that drew on the pioneering work of the engineer 
Archibald Leitch, and which embodied the more architectural approach to stadium 
design that was current in the 1920s and 1930s. 

1.0 Introduction 

In February 2003 Birmingham University Field Archaeology Unit (BUFAU) 
undertook an archaeological desk-based assessment on behalf of DearsBrack (Hancox 
and Hislop 2003), ahead of the proposed redevelopment of the City Stadium, Filbert 
Street, Leicester, the former ground of Leicester City Football Club. Although there 
is, as yet, no national conservation policy on football buildings, the importance of 
England's sporting heritage has been recognised through a recent Manchester-based 
pilot study, sponsored by English Heritage (Cooper 2002, Inglis 2002, Chitty and 
Wood 2002), and the recommendation of the assessment was that building recording 
of the South Stand be carried out prior to demolition. 

In response to these recommendations the developers made a digital format 
photographic record of the South Stand and other aspects of the stadium. On the basis 
of the desk-based assessment and the digital images, the Leicester City Archaeologist 
recommended that a photographic survey of the south stand be carried out or 
completed by a suitably qualified organisation in accordance with RCHME guidelines 
(RCHME 1996). However, by that time demolition of the South Stand had 
commenced, rendering the recommendation impractical. A second recommendation 
was made to take account of the changed situation, whereby the existing digital 
photographs were to be supplemented by a paper archive of images, a set of 'thumb­
nail images' to act as a visual index, annotated drawings to support the photographic 
record, and a documentary summary. In addition, a set of transparencies was to be 
produced from the digital images. 

2.0 Location and Character of the Area 

The site of the City Stadium is located just to the south of Leicester city centre, 
outside the Roman and medieval towns (NGR SK 58130278, Figs. 1 and 2). The 
football ground lay within a working class area of terraced housing and factories, 
built up around the tum of the 19th and 20th centuries. The north side of the ground 
was bounded by Filbert Street, and the east side by Burnmoor Street, formerly 
Grasmere Street. To the west was a car park, and to the south factories. 
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3.0 Objectives 

• To index and archive the existing photographs
• To provide a record of the South Stand

4.0 Methods 

The digital images were identified from memory, provided with picture and written 
indexes (the latter reproduced as an appendix to this report), and a paper archive 
produced. A set of transparencies was produced from the digital images. Colour 
prints taken during the desk-based assessment were added to the archive. The 
historical summary is based on the desk-based assessment (Hancox and Hislop 2003), 
and the building description on the photographic record, and from notes made during 
a short inspection in respect of the desk-based assessment. 

5.0 Historical Summary of the City Stadium 

The area in which the City Stadium was situated was developed during the latter half 
of the 19th century. By 1871 the eastern half of Filbert Street had been built up, 
though the area later occupied by the football ground was depicted as open fields in 
1886 when the first large-scale Ordnance Survey map appeared. The ground was laid 
out and the first game played in 1891. In 1900 the pitch was extended by 50ft to the 
south. The wooden terracing that had been behind the south goal was moved to the 
north end, and replaced with terracing built on an earthen bank. It was nicknamed 
'Spion Kop' after the Boer War battle fought on the eponymous ridge. The stadium is 
first depicted in the cartographic record on the rd edition of the I :2500 Ordnance 
Survey map of 1904, which shows that there was a covered stand on the west side 
only (Hancox and Hislop 2003). 

The Leicester City Football Club Company Ltd was fmmed in 1919, and shortly 
afterwards, in March 1921, work started on the construction of a new main stand on 
the west side of the ground, to the designs of the architect W.E. Moore. It was erected 
behind the then existing stand, which was afterwards demolished and the pitch moved 
30 feet towards the west. In 1927 the roof from the Spion Kop, or the South Stand, 
was removed and re-erected at the north end, the stand itself being replaced by a new 
double-decker stand, which was erected to what is said to have been an almost 
identical design that of the West Stand at West Ham's Boleyn Ground, Upton Park, 
the creation of Sir E.O. Williams and DJ.Moss (Inglis 1987, 258). Contrary to the 
suggestion that the same designer and contractor were employed at both sites (Foulger 
2002, 40), the Filbert Street South Stand was the work of Leicester architect, Norman 
Read, and the engineer, W. J. Cearns of Stratford, whose drawings are preserved at 
the Leicestershire Record Office (Building Plan 32798) One of these drawings, a 
section through the building is reproduced here as Fig.3. 

More recent developments were the constrnction of executive boxes over the north 
terrace in 1974, and in 1993-4 the building of a new West (Carling) Stand to replace 
the construction of 1921 (Hancox and Hislop 2003). 
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